

November 21,2018

On Wednesday, November 21, 2018 at 9:00 a.m., the Police Jury of Sabine Parish, State of Louisiana met in open and regular session.

The Agenda was as follows:

1. Call to Order
2. Roll Call
3. Prayer
4. Pledge of Allegiance
5. Amend the Agenda
6. Adopt the Agenda
7. Accept the Minutes of the Previous Regular Meeting, October 17, 2018 and of the Previous Special Called Meeting, October 30, 2018
8. Planning Commission
9. Mr. Ray McComic and Pastor James Philen- Century Road Concerned Citizens-Discuss Road Condition
10. Reappoint Mr. Michael Walker as a Commissioner for the South Toledo Bend Water District
11. Appoint a Commissioner to the Long-Range Water Planning Advisory Committee to Replace Mr. Frank Davis
12. 2019 Bids for Materials, Supplies, and Services – Take Under Advisement (Opened 11/7/18)
13. Set Date and Time for Public Hearing on Proposed Budget for Fiscal Year Ended December 31, 2019
14. Discuss and Adopt the Three-Year Priority Road List Required by the Parish Transportation Act.
15. Discuss Possible Salary Increase for Parish Employees
16. Discuss Short-term Disability Insurance Coverage for Employees
17. Consider Hiring Mr. Kent Hardin as Bridge Inspector for the Sabine Parish Police Jury
18. Consider Hiring Mr. Thomas Watson as a Permanent Employee Effective December 1, 2018
19. Authorize Payment of Approved Bills
20. Appropriate Sales Tax for November Operations (\$215,000)
21. Committee Reports
22. Operations
23. Adjournment

1. Call to Order

President Ronald L. Bison called the meeting to order.

2. Roll Call

The roll was called by the Secretary Treasurer. The following jurors were present: Willes Funderburk, Mike McCormic, “Charlie” Brown, William E. Ruffin, “Ronny” Bison, Eric Garcie, Kenneth M. Ebarb, and “Randy” Byrd.

The following member arrived late: Ricky ”K-Wall” Sepulvado

3. Prayer

Prayer was led by Mr. William E. Ruffin.

4. Pledge of Allegiance

The Pledge of Allegiance was led by Mr. Charlie Brown.

5. Amend the Agenda

There was no amendment made to the agenda.

Mr. Ricky ”K-Wall” Sepulvado joined the meeting at this time.

Police Jury President, Ronny Bison, allowed a period of public comment on any item on the agenda. Mr. Bison advised everyone that they would be allowed to comment later during the meeting on particular agenda items, if they desire. There were no public comments at this time.

6. Adopt the Agenda

Resolution No. 8181

Motion by Brown and seconded by Ruffin to adopt the agenda.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

7. Accept the Minutes of the Previous Regular Meeting, October 17, 2018 and of the Previous Special Called Meeting, October 30, 2018

All Police Jurors have previously been provided a written copy of the minutes of the regular meeting held on October 17, 2018 and the special called meeting held on October 30, 2018.

Resolution No. 8182

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by McCormic to accept the minutes of the regular meeting held on October 17, 2018 and the special called meeting held on October 30, 2018.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

8. Planning Commission

No Member of the Sabine Parish Planning Commission was present.

9. Mr. Ray McComic and Pastor James Philen- Century Road Concerned Citizens-Discuss Road Condition

Mr. Ray McComic and Pastor James Philen were in attendance and addressed the Police Jury concerning the condition of Century Road. Mr. McComic requested that Century Road be placed on the Parish Transportation Act Capital Improvement Priority List.

Mr. McComic and Pastor Philen were informed that Century Road will be considered for inclusion in the 2019 Parish Transportation Act Capital Improvement Priority List.

10. Reappoint Mr. Michael Walker as a Commissioner for the South Toledo Bend Water District

On November 14, 2018, the Police Jury received a letter from the South Toledo Bend Water District requesting that it reappoint Mr. Michael Walker as a commissioner to the District. Mr. Walker's current appointment expires January 17, 2019.

Resolution No. 8183

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Funderburk to reappoint Mr. Michael Walker to the board of commissioners of the South Toledo Bend Water District for a five-year term ending January 17, 2024.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

11. Appoint a Commissioner to the Long-Range Water Planning Advisory Committee to Replace Mr. Frank Davis

On October 15, 2018, the Police Jury was notified by Mr. Frank Davis that he was immediately

resigning as a committee member of the Sabine Parish Long-Range Water Planning Advisory Committee. The Long-Range Water Planning Advisory Committee was formed by the Sabine Parish Police Jury on December 16, 2009 by Resolution No. 6609 with the committee members having no term limit.

President Bison directed Secretary Treasurer Weatherford to contact the Pendleton Water Association, Inc. to request their recommendation for a committee member.

12. 2019 Bids for Materials, Supplies, and Services – Take Under Advisement (Opened 11/7/18)

Sealed bids were received in the Police Jury Office, at the Courthouse, Many, Louisiana, until 10:00 a.m. on November 7, 2018 for 2019 materials, supplies, and services at which time they were opened and read aloud. The bid advertisement stated that the bids would be presented to the Police Jury today, Wednesday, November 21, 2018 during the regularly scheduled meeting and then would be taken under advisement and awarded prior to January 1, 2019. The Secretary Treasurer has provided the Jurors and Road Superintendent Hughes a copy of all bids opened along with the bid tabulation. The bid tabulation is as follows:

BID TABULATION – 2019

1. Hot Mix

(a) Prairie Contractors, LLC

Hot Mix – FOB Leesville Plant \$73.50 per ton

(b) Madden Contracting Company, LLC.

Hot Mix – FOB Natchitoches Plant \$70.75 per ton

Hot Mix – FOB Shreveport Plant \$70.75 per ton

(c) East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.

Hot Mix – FOB Center, TX Plant \$75.00 per ton

Hot Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$87.20 per ton

Hot Mix- FOB Lufkin, TX Plant \$75.00 per ton

Hot Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$89.20 per ton

2. Oil Sand Mix (Oil Dirt)

(a) East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.

Oil Sand – FOB Center, TX Plant \$62.00 per ton

Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA \$74.20 per ton

Oil Sand – FOB Lufkin, TX Plant \$62.00 per ton

Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA \$76.20 per ton

Oil Sand – FOB Rebecca, TX Plant \$67.00 per ton

Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA \$76.20 per ton

3. Pug Mill Service

No bid received.

4. Hot Mix/Oil Sand Mix Installation with Lay Down Machine

(a) Acklin Asphalt

Hot mix/ oil sand installation with a laydown machine. \$11.39 per ton

(b) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Hot mix/ oil sand installation with a laydown machine. \$11.10 per ton

(c) Delta Sealcoating Plus, LLC

Hot mix/ oil sand installation with a laydown machine. \$12.00 per ton

5. Cold Mix

(a) Diamond B Construction Co. LLC

Cold Mix – FOB Alexandria Plant \$80.00 per ton
Cold Mix – Delivered to Many, LA \$95.00 per ton

(b) East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.

Cold Mix- FOB Center, TX Plant \$75.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$87.20 per ton

Cold Mix- FOB Lufkin, TX Plant \$70.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$84.20 per ton

Cold Mix- FOB Rebecca, TX Plant \$75.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$84.20 per ton

Cold Mix- FOB Paxton, TX Plant \$74.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA \$85.40 per ton

6. One, Two, Three Course Gravel/ Road Oil Seal Application

No bid received.

7. Milling of Selected Asphalted Roads

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Milling \$.42 per square yard

(b) Delta Sealcoating Plus, LLC

Milling \$.4.00 per square yard

8. Milling and Compacting of Selected Parish Roads that were Previously Overlaid with Oil Sand

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Milling and compaction \$.46 per square yard

9. Road Oil

(a) Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil Co., Inc.

Oil will be refined product and will meet the State of Texas Department of Highways 1993 standard specification item #300. All oil will be delivered per ton from Trinity Asphalt Ltd., Henderson Texas to any point in Sabine Parish. This bid is based on current posted prices, any increase or decrease in posted price shall be passed along to the Parish. \$580.00 per ton

10. Backhoe Services

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Backhoe services \$70.00 per hour

11. Trackhoe Services

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Trackhoe services – 320 Caterpillar \$130.00 per hour
Trackhoe services – 315 Caterpillar \$120.00 per hour
Trackhoe services – 304 Caterpillar \$100.00 per hour

(b) Procell Service

Trackhoe services- John Deere 160 \$ 85.00 per hour

(c) Taylor Dozer & Backhoe, LLC

Trackhoe services- John Deere 130 \$130.00 per hour

12. Bulldozer Services

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Bulldozer services – D-5 Caterpillar \$110.00 per hour

- | | | |
|-----|--|-------------------|
| | Bulldozer services – 550 John Deere | \$110.00 per hour |
| | (b) <u>Procell Service</u> | |
| | Bulldozer services- John Deere 700 | \$ 85.00 per hour |
| | Bulldozer services- D5 Caterpillar | \$ 85.00 per hour |
| | Bulldozer services- John Deere 650 | \$ 85.00 per hour |
| | (c) <u>Taylor Dozer & Backhoe, LLC</u> | |
| | Bulldozer services- John Deere 650 | \$115.00 per hour |
| 13. | Material Hauling Services – 14-yard Dump Truck | |
| | (a) <u>Procell Service.</u> | |
| | Material hauling services- 14-yard
dump truck | \$50.00 per hour |
| | (b) <u>Taylor Dozer & Backhoe, LLC</u> | |
| | Material hauling services- 16-yard
dump truck | \$80.00 per hour |
| | (c) <u>Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.</u> | |
| | Material hauling services- 14-yard
dump truck | \$70.00 per hour |
| 14. | Material Hauling Services – 24 Yard Belly Dump Truck | |
| | No bid received. | |
| 15. | Pest Control | |
| | (a) <u>A&A Pest Solutions LLC</u> | |
| | Courthouse | \$90.00 per month |
| | Health Unit | \$65.00 per month |
| | Clerk of Court Storage Building | \$25.00 per month |
| | Road Warehouse and Equipment Building | \$40.00 per month |
| | (b) <u>Daniel Allen Pest Services, LLC</u> | |
| | Courthouse | \$80.00 per month |
| | Health Unit | \$50.00 per month |
| | Clerk of Court Storage Building | \$20.00 per month |
| | Road Warehouse and Equipment Building | \$40.00 per month |
| | Annex | Free |
| 16. | Welding | |
| | (a) <u>Grady Hill Repair Center</u> | |
| | Welding service. Road service at same price.
Road service includes time for travel to
and from the job location | \$75.00 per hour |
| | (b) <u>Byles Welding & Tractor Co., Inc.</u> | |
| | Welding labor both in-shop and done in field.
Labor done in field includes time for travel to
and from the job location. | \$75.00 per hour |
| 17. | Creosote Lumber Timbers and Piling – (Class B) | |
| | No bid received. | |
| 18. | Corrugated Steel Galvanized Plain Round Culverts and Bands | |
| | (a) <u>Brumley Culvert Co. LLC</u> | |
| | Meet the specifications of the Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development
and the Sabine Parish Police Jury Road Committee and engineers. American made with
American steel. | |
| | Manufactured in Louisiana; therefore, according to Louisiana Preference Law, LRS
39:1595, the Vendor is requesting a 10% preference for products manufactured in
Louisiana. No minimum orders. Prices are FOB delivered parish wide, at single culvert | |

prices without any delivery charges. Prices quoted as per November 7, 2018. Future price increases will be added with manufacturer's documentation. Annular Bands: 1' wide = 1' of pipe, 2' wide = 2' of pipe. Special order bands- price quote as per job specifications.

(b) Family Farm & Garden

The price quoted is a delivered cost. Culverts are manufactured in the United States. Band prices are not bid. Prices are FOB delivered parish wide, at single culvert prices without any delivery charges.

(c) Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.

In accordance with Louisiana Preference Law, LRS 39:1595, the vendor is requesting a 10% preference for products manufactured in Louisiana. Band prices are not bid. Prices are FOB delivered parish wide, at single culvert prices without any delivery charges.

Note: Culvert unit prices are for each foot of pipe.

		Brumley Culvert	Family Farm & Garden	Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.
2&2/3 x 1/2 Corrugation		<u>Pipe</u>	<u>Pipe</u>	<u>Pipe</u>
<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Gauge</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>
12"	16	\$10.39	\$9.96	\$10.29
15"	16	\$12.25	\$12.44	\$12.22
18"	16	\$14.88	\$14.88	\$15.15
21"	16	\$16.95	\$17.36	\$17.27
24"	16	\$19.39	\$19.80	\$19.15
24"	14	\$24.50	\$23.76	\$24.11
30"	16	\$24.50	\$24.80	\$24.84
30"	14	\$30.95	\$29.84	\$30.33
36"	14	\$36.95	\$35.72	\$37.07
42"	14	\$44.50	\$41.72	\$48.48
48"	14	\$50.95	\$47.72	\$57.22
3x1 Corrugation				
60"	16	\$59.95	\$58.88	\$66.08
60"	14	\$71.95	\$70.08	\$81.14
66"	16	\$68.57	\$60.00	\$75.01
66"	14	\$80.89	\$72.33	\$92.12
72"	14	\$88.95	\$84.72	\$100.42
84"	14	\$102.95	\$98.00	\$117.38
96"	12	\$154.95	\$151.32	\$184.02
108"	10	No Bid	\$215.88	\$264.10
120"	10	No Bid	\$239.88	\$302.22
132"	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
132"	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$450.00
144"	10	No Bid	\$287.88	No Bid
144"	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$550.00

19. **Used Railroad Tank Shell Culverts**

(a) The Railroad Yard

Tanks are patched with bulk heads removed and wall thickness is .500w to .625w. All prices include delivery on company owned trucks which allow for rolling off the tank without the expense of hiring a crane to lift them off.

<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Length</u>	<u>Price Per Linear Foot</u>
8'6" – 10'3"	29.5' -39.9 feet	\$245.00 per linear foot
8'6" – 10'3"	40.0' – 49.9 feet	\$240.00 per linear foot
8'6" – 10'3"	50.0' – 70.0 feet	\$235.00 per linear foot

20. **Tires**

(a) Ark-La-Tex Discount Tire, LLC.

Tires listed are made in the USA as well as imported. Countries of origin for tires imported include Japan, Korea, China, and Indonesia.

Availability of tire brands, and especially models, regularly change in the tire manufacturing industry. Because of this, no guarantee can be made that a particular brand, model, etc., will be available at any given time, nor for how long. All prices and availability are subject to industry changes.

<u>Size</u>	<u>Brand/Tread</u>	<u>Ply Rating</u>	<u>Price</u>
LT225/75R16	Ironman HT	10	\$139.25
LT225/75R16	Ironman AT	10	\$139.25
235/75R16	Nexen HTX	4	\$143.25
235/75R16	Hankook AT	XL	\$156.25
LT235/85R16	Kenda AP	10	\$164.50
LT235/85R16	Nexen MT	10	\$183.25
LT235/80R17	Ironman CHT	10	\$153.25
LT235/80R17	Ironman AT	10	\$153.25
LT245/75R17	Ironman CHT	10	\$153.25
LT245/75R17	Ironman AT	10	\$153.25
LT265/75R16	Ironman RB	10	\$154.25
LT265/75R16	Ironman AT	10	\$159.25
ST235/80R16	Cargomax	10	\$103.25
ST205/75R15	Cargomax	8	\$89.25
7.50-16	Zeemax Express	10	\$113.25
245/70R17	Nexen HTX	4	\$159.25
245/70R17	Ironman AT	4	\$149.25
265/70R17	Ironman AP	4	\$149.25
265/70R17	Ironman AT	4	\$149.25
245/75R16	Ironman AP	4	\$129.25
245/75R16	Ironman AT	4	\$133.25
245/75R22.5	Sumitomo Steer	14	\$314.50
LT285/75R16	Ironman AT	10	\$169.25
LT285/75R16	Ironman MT	10	\$203.25
7.00-15	Zeemax	8	\$93.25
17.5-25	Alliance	12	\$635.00
17.5R25	Boto	2*Radial	\$1,039.00
10.00-16	Cropmax	8	\$171.50
8.3-16	OTR	6	\$260.00
14.9-24	Agstar	8	\$254.00
14.00R24	Boto	1*Radial	\$950.00
16.0/70-20	Deestone	14	\$393.00
11L-16	Maxdura	12	\$175.00
18.4-30	Cropmax	10	\$563.00
460/85R34	BKT	147A8/B	\$1,045.00
18.4-34	Alliance	8	\$625.00
12.5/80-18	Deestone	14	\$280.00
7.50-16	Cropmax	8	\$133.00
9.5-24	Alliance	6	\$239.00
19.5L-24	Deestone	12	\$556.00
16.9-30	Cropmax	8	\$484.00
11L-15	Deestone	12	\$192.50
20.5R25	Titan	2*Radial	\$1,880.00
13.6-24	Agstar	8	\$330.00
15.5-25	Alliance	12	\$515.00
15.5R25	Maxam	2* Radial	\$981.00
14.9-28	Cropmax	8	\$441.00
9.00R20	Vitour (set)	14	\$309.00
10.00R20	Zeemax	14	\$254.00
10.00R20	Vitour (set)	18	\$310.00

425/65R22.5	Greatway	20	\$434.50
425/65R22.5	Ironman	20	\$531.50
11R24.5	Synergy	16	\$324.50
11R24.5	Hankook Prem Steer	14	\$420.50
295/75R22.5	Synergy (hwy)	14	\$294.50
295/75R22.5	Lancaster (grip)	14	\$274.50
10R22.5	Americus (hwy)	14	\$310.50
10R22.5	Hankook (grip)	14	\$394.50
11R22.5	Vitour Steer	14	\$294.50
11R22.5	Lancaster (grip)	14	\$294.50
16.00R24	Firestone	16	\$2,045.00
13.00-24	Deestone	12	\$445.00
11.5/80-15.3	BKT	12	\$242.50

(b) Stewart's Auto Sales

All prices include mounting and balancing where applicable. All 10 ply and 12 ply tires are load range E and all 4 ply tires are load range C. No tires are included on a state contract.

<u>Size</u>	<u>Brand/Tread</u>	<u>Ply Rating</u>	<u>Price</u>
LT285/75R16	Zeetex – all terrain	10	\$155.00
LT225/75R16	Ironman-all terrain	10	\$126.00
LT225/75R16	V-Rubber HT	10	\$124.00
235/75R16	Delta HT	4	\$92.00
235/75R16	Mastercraft AT	4	\$144.00
LT235/80R17	Grantland HT	10	\$133.00
LT235/80R17	Mudclaw AT	10	\$173.00
LT245/75R17	Americus HT	10	\$128.00
LT245/75R17	Ironman AT	10	\$143.00
LT265/75R16	Nokia HT	10	\$119.00
LT265/75R16	V-Rubber AT	10	\$131.00
LT265/75R16	Mudstar	10	\$169.00
LT285/75R16	Mudstar Mudgrip	10	\$176.00
245/70R17	Americus AT	4	\$129.00
245/70R17	Americus HT	4	\$115.00
LT245/70R17	Americus all position	10	\$133.00
LT235/85R16	Milestar HT	10	\$125.00
LT235/85R16	Federal Mud-Terrain	10	\$156.00
265/70R17	Americus HT	4	\$126.00
265/70R17	Americus AT	4	\$131.00
245/75R16	Hankook HT	4	\$125.00
245/75R16	Ironman AT	4	\$136.00
LT275/70R18	Americus HT	10	\$145.00
LT275/70R18	Ironman AT	10	\$170.00
7.50-16	Super A Trailer	10	\$94.00
7.50-16	Zeemax Trailer	14	\$114.00
235/80/16	Cargo Max	10	\$85.00
7.00-15	Super A	10	\$88.00
205/75/15	Super A	8	\$65.00

(c) Sabine Tire, Inc.

Vendor can also deliver Michelin, B F Goodrich, and Uniroyal tires on state contract prices.

All tires will be mounted and balanced except tires that are bought on state contract prices.

<u>Size</u>	<u>Brand/Tread</u>	<u>Ply Rating</u>	<u>Price</u>
LT285/75R16	Cooper AT3	10	\$189.54
LT285/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$135.98

LT225/75R16	Summit Trail Climber Hwy	10	\$103.24
LT225/75R16	Cooper HT3	10	\$148.98
LT235/85R16	Cooper HT3	10	\$152.80
LT235/85R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$109.77
LT235/80R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$125.90
LT235/80R17	Cooper HT3	10	\$177.18
LT235/80R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$124.82
LT235/80R17	Mud Claw MT	10	\$165.67
LT245/75R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$125.80
LT245/75R17	Cooper HT3	10	\$177.76
LT245/75R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$130.26
LT245/75R17	Mud Claw MT	10	\$152.37
LT265/75R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$128.44
LT265/75R16	Cooper HT3	10	\$166.00
LT265/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$131.37
LT265/75R16	Mud Claw MT	10	\$141.39
245/70R17	Summit Trail Climber	4	\$99.70
245/70R17	Cooper Evolution	4	\$139.73
245/70R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	4	\$134.50
265/70R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	4	\$108.33
265/70R17	Cooper Evolution HT	4	\$143.69
265/70R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	4	\$116.71
265/70R17	Mud Claw MT	10	\$144.54
245/75R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	4	\$105.39
245/75R16	Cooper Evolution HT	4	\$132.68
245/75R16	Mud Claw MT	4	\$134.33
235/85R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$109.33
235/85R16	Cooper HT3	10	\$152.80
235/85R16	Mud Claw MT	10	\$144.68
275/70R18	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$148.57
275/70R18	Cooper HT3	10	\$199.76
285/75R16	Mud Claw MT	10	\$151.57
750x16	PowerKing Hwy	10	\$94.25
700x15	Super Hwy	10	\$78.26
235/80R16	Master Track ST	10	\$76.07
ST205/75R15	Master Track ST		\$60.58
900R20	Hwy	14	\$286.63
175.5R25	Hercules Loader	2 star	\$852.38
17.5x25	Hercules Loader	12	\$732.43
1000x16	Petlas Tri Rib	8	\$133.05
1400R24	Max Grader		\$795.00
11Lx16	Hercules F3 Backhoe	12	\$148.09
11.5/80-15.3	BKT	12	\$204.60
11LX15	Premium Backhoe	10	\$126.84
20.5R25	Hercules Radial	2 star	\$1,166.10
9.5x24	Petlas R-1	8	\$159.85
1000R20	Sumitomo Hwy	16	\$333.82
1000R20	Samson Trac	16	\$370.30
19.5R25	Hercules Loader	12	\$562.57
14.9x24	Petlas R-1	8	\$340.17
380/85R24	Alliance R-1 FM Pro 2	8	\$605.65
18.4x30	Petlas R-1	8	\$485.32
460/85R34	Alliance R-1 FM Pro2	8	\$965.95
12.5/80-18	Backhoe Front	14	\$235.12
12.5/80-18	Harvest King R-4	12	\$250.61
750x16	Petlas R-1	8	\$85.94
16.9x30	Petlas R-1	8	\$446.20
11Lx15	Premium Backhoe F3	10	\$136.25
14.9x28	Petlas R-1	8	\$361.12
1600x24	Firestone G-2	16	\$1,595.00
19.5Lx24	Petlas R-4	12	\$471.96

13.6x24	Patlas R-1	8	\$364.59
1300x24	Hercules Grader	12	\$445.00
1300x24	ATF Grader	12	\$352.54
245/75R22.5	Sumitomo Steer	14	\$256.82
295/75R22.5	TrackMaster Steer	14	\$260.01
295/75R22.5	Roadshine Closed Shoulder Drive	14	\$253.46
11R22.5	TrackMaster Steer	16	\$248.68
11R22.5	Roadshine Closed Shoulder Drive	16	\$252.44
11R24.5	TrackMaster Steer	16	\$260.18
11R24.5	Roadshine CS Drive	16	\$269.18
10R22.5	Sumitomo Hwy	14	\$289.61
10R22.5	Dyna Track Lug	14	\$272.53
425/65R22.5	Roadshine Hwy	20	\$412.29
425/65R22.5	Ironman Mixed SUV Traction	20	\$500.77

21. **Gravel and Crushed Rock**

21(a). **Gravel Oversize**

No bid received.

21(b) **Gravel Oversize Maintenance**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

Oversized Maintenance Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$32.00 per ton
Many	\$32.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$32.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$32.00 per ton

21(c) **Gravel Graded Oversize Maintenance**

No bid received.

21(d) **Gravel – Maintenance**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

Maintenance Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$29.00 per ton
Many	\$29.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$29.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$29.00 per ton

21(e) **Gravel C1**

(a) Prairie Contractors, LLC.

Gravel – 57's size (Concrete Size- C1)

FOB Plant- DeRidder, LA or Leesville, LA \$33.75 per ton

21(f) **Gravel C-2**

No bid received.

21(g) **Gravel C3**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

C-3 Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$29.00 per ton
Many	\$29.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$29.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$29.00 per ton

(b) Prairie Contractors, LLC.

Pea gravel-(Size – C-3)

FOB Plant- DeRidder, LA or Leesville, LA \$31.50 per ton

(c) East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD

Pea gravel:

FOB Plant- Paxton, TX	\$41.00 per ton
Delivered -	\$52.40 per ton
21(h) Crushed Rock-Glaucanite – (Black Rock)	
(a) <u>Big 4, Inc.</u>	
Road Base:	
FOB Plant- Hemphill, TX	\$10.00 per ton
	\$12.00 per cubic yard
Filter Rock 2" x 4":	
FOB Plant- Hemphill, TX	\$16.50 per ton
	\$16.50 per cubic yard
Rock 3" x 5":	
FOB Plant – Hemphill, TX	\$16.50 per ton
	\$16.50 per cubic yard
Rip Rap:	
FOB Plant – Hemphill, TX	\$18.50 per ton
	\$18.50 per cubic yard
21(i) Winn Rock	
(a) <u>Winn Rock LLC</u>	
Crushed stone (Winn Rock) SB-2 Stone	
2 ½ top size with 0-25% passing #4 screen	
FOB Winnfield, LA	\$19.00 per ton
Base course stone 6" top size with 0-25% Passing #4 screen – FOB Winnfield, LA	
	\$19.50 per ton
Screenings – FOB Winnfield, LA	
	\$ 9.80 per ton
21(j) Limestone – Super Flex Base	
(a) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD</u>	
Limestone Base:	
FOB Plant- Paxton, TX	\$28.50 per ton
Delivered -	\$39.90 per ton
FOB Plant – Rebecca, TX	
Delivered	\$28.00 per ton
	\$36.50 per ton
FOB Plant – Lufkin, TX	
Delivered	\$28.50 per ton
	\$42.70 per ton
SB 2 Base:	
FOB Plant- Paxton, TX	\$32.00 per ton
Delivered -	\$43.40 per ton
FOB Plant- Lufkin, TX	
Delivered -	\$32.00 per ton
	\$46.20 per ton
(b) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u>	
Standard Base:	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$26.86 per ton
FOB Plant – Leesville, LA	\$28.86 per ton
21(k) Limestone- #57 – 1 ½ "Stone	
(a) <u>Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC</u>	
#57 Limestone:	

Delivered:	
Florien	\$43.00 per ton
Many	\$43.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$43.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$43.00 per ton

(b) Madden Contracting Company, LLC.

#57 Stone	
FOB Plant – Mansfield, LA	\$36.00 per ton
FOB Plant- Natchitoches, LA	\$34.00 per ton

(c) East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD

#57 Stone	
FOB Paxton	\$32.00 per ton
Delivered	\$43.40 per ton

FOB Rebecca	\$33.00 per ton
Delivered	\$41.50 per ton

(d) Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC

#57 Stone – 1 ½ Stone	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$29.79 per ton

21(l) **Limestone #67 – 1” Stone**

(a) Madden Contracting Company, LLC.

#67 Stone:	
FOB Plant – Mansfield, LA	\$36.00 per ton
FOB Plant- Natchitoches, LA	\$34.00 per ton

21(m) **Limestone Rip Rap – 1”-12”**

(a) Madden Contracting Company, LLC

Any Rip Rap	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$41.75 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$40.50 per ton

(b) East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD

Rip Rap -12”	
FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX	\$45.50 per ton
Delivered –	\$57.90 per ton

FOB – Plant – Rebecca, TX	\$39.50 per ton
Delivered –	\$49.00 per ton

Rip Rap – 18”-24”-36”	
FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX	\$58.00 per ton
Delivered –	\$72.40 per ton

(c) Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC

1”x12” Rip Rap	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$30.18 per ton

21(n) **Limestone #8 – ½ “Stone for Chip Seal**

(a) Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC

#8 Stone ½”	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$34.60 per ton

21(o) **Limestone 3” x 5” Stone**

(a) Madden Contracting Company, LLC

B Stone	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$31.25 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$30.75 per ton

(b)East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD
 1" x 3" or 3"x5" Stone
 FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX \$39.50 per ton
 Delivered - \$50.90 per ton

FOB – Plant – Rebecca \$39.50 per ton
 Delivered - \$48.00 per ton

(c)Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC
 3" x 5" Stone
 FOB Plant- Deridder, LA \$29.67 per ton

21(p) **Crushed Arkansas Rock/ Rhyolite**

(a)Prairie Contractors, LLC.
 Road Base- crushed rhyolite stone:
 FOB Plant- DeRidder, LA or Leesville, LA \$28.75 per ton

ASTM Number 57's,67's and 8s-
 Crushed rhyolite stone:
 FOB Plant- DeRidder, LA or Leesville, LA \$32.00 per ton

5" x 0 Surge Rock and 2 ½ x 0 Ballasts
 Rhyolite crushed stone "Surge"
 FOB Plant- DeRidder, LA or Leesville, LA \$32.25 per ton

(b)Madden Contracting Company, LLC.
 LA 610 Base
 FOB Plant:
 Mansfield, LA \$30.25 per ton
 Natchitoches, LA \$28.75 per ton

Class 7 Base
 FOB Plant:
 Mansfield, LA \$30.00 per ton
 Natchitoches, LA \$28.50 per ton

1 ½ "Base
 FOB Plant:
 Mansfield, LA \$28.00 per ton
 Natchitoches, LA \$26.50 per ton

3" Base
 FOB Plant:
 Mansfield, LA \$31.25 per ton
 Natchitoches, LA \$30.50 per ton

(c) Apeck Aggregate Supply, LLC
 La 610 Base:
 FOB Plant – DeRidder, LA \$29.18 per ton
 FOB Plant – Leesville, LA \$29.89 per ton

Commercial Base:
 FOB Plant – DeRidder, LA \$27.96 per ton
 FOB Plant – Leesville, LA \$28.64 per ton

Number 57- Arkansas Crushed Stone:
 FOB Plant – DeRidder, LA \$30.46 per ton
 FOB Plant – Leesville, LA \$32.96 per ton

The Jury will schedule a workshop prior to the regular December meeting to review and compare bids.

Resolution No. 8184

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Garcie to take the materials, supplies, and services bids for 2019 under advisement until the regularly scheduled December 19, 2018 Police Jury meeting with the bid awards to be made at that time (said bids opened on November 7, 2018 at 10:00 a.m.)

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

13. Set Date and Time for Public Hearing on Proposed Budget for Fiscal Year Ended December 31, 2019

Louisiana Revised Statute 39:1307(A) requires a police jury with total expenditures of \$500,000 or more from general fund and any special revenue funds to afford the public an opportunity to participate in the budget process prior to adoption of the budget.

The Sabine Parish Police Jury will adopt its 2019 Budget at its regularly scheduled meeting which will be held at 9:00 a.m. on Wednesday, December 19, 2018.

Resolution No. 8185

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Ebarb to hold a public hearing on the 2019 Budget in the Police Jury Meeting Room in the Courthouse located at 400 S. Capitol Street, Room 101, Many, Louisiana, on December 19, 2018 at 8:30 a.m.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

14. Discuss and Adopt the Three-Year Priority Road List Required by the Parish Transportation Act.

Louisiana Revised Statute 48:755 requires parishes to adopt a parish-wide capital improvements program that shall list all projects to be constructed using Parish Transportation Act funds during the fiscal year and the following two years. Parish Transportation Act funds shall be used for the benefit of the parish as a whole and within the priority ranking for the parish. The most critical needs existing parish-wide according to the priority ranking shall be met first.

All projects listed for the total three-year plan shall be approved by the parish governing authority and shall be adopted prior to the beginning of the first year of the three-year plan

Resolution No. 8186

Motion by Byrd and seconded by Garcie to table consideration of the Three-Year Priority Road List required by the Parish Transportation Act until the next regularly scheduled meeting which will be held on December 19, 2018.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

15. Discuss Possible Salary Increase for Parish Employees

Mr. McCormic reported that the Finance Committee had met and discussed possible salary increases for Police Jury employees. He noted that Jury employees have not received an increase in their base salaries during the last five years. He requested all Police Jurors to consider a possible raise for employees and share their thoughts with the Finance Committee.

Mr. Ebarb reminded everyone that funds used to provide pay raises for employees ultimately results in a decrease in funds available for road repairs. Mr. Ebarb discussed

many issues that should be considered in determining the increase in pay to each employee. Mr. Ruffin noted that the Police Jury is losing employees due to a low rate of pay. President Bison stated that he felt that the Police Jury's employees deserve a raise.

Mr. Sepulvado suggested referring the salary increase for Police Jury employees to the Finance Committee. Mr. Ruffin informed the Jury that a Finance Committee meeting is scheduled for November 27, 2018 and the possible pay raise for employees will be fully discussed. He further stated that the Finance Committee will present a recommendation to the full Jury during the December 19, 2018 meeting.

16. Discuss Short-term Disability Insurance Coverage for Employees

On October 30, 2018, Ms. Natasha Berry and Christine Broussard presented the Police Jury proposals for providing employees defined benefit short-term disability insurance.

Mr. Ebarb noted that providing this fringe benefit to Jury employees would add additional costs and is not feasible due to the proposed salary increase. He noted that employees currently can purchase short-term disability insurance.

President Bison closed discussion of this item.

17. Consider Hiring Mr. Kent Hardin as Bridge Inspector for the Sabine Parish Police Jury

Nowlin and Associates has notified the Police Jury that they will no longer provide bridge inspection services to the Parish. Mr. Kent Hardin has been recommended to perform the bridge inspections required by the Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development. Secretary Treasurer Weatherford has contacted Mr. Hardin and obtained Mr. Hardin's employment requirements.

Mr. Hardin requests that the Sabine Parish Police Jury hire him as a part-time employee at the rate of forty dollars (\$40.00) per hour with time starting when he leaves his residence and ending upon his return. He will provide his own transportation and will be paid mileage for his travel at the current federal rate.

Resolution No. 8187

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Ebarb to hire Mr. Kent Hardin as a part-time employee of the Police Jury to perform bridge inspections required by the Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development. Mr. Hardin will be paid at the rate of forty dollars (\$40.00) per hour with time starting when he leaves his residence and ending upon his return. He will provide his own transportation and will be paid mileage for his travel at the current federal rate. He will not participate in the normal payroll "STEP" plan increases provided by the Police Jury. Employment will be contingent upon him passing the required physical examination and drug test.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

18 Consider Hiring Mr. Thomas Watson as a Permanent Employee Effective December 1, 2018.

Mr. Thomas Watson was hired as a temporary employee on December 18, 2017, primarily working in Road Districts No. 1 and 11 (Wards 6 & 10). At that time, he passed the required physical examination and drug test. There is currently an opening for a permanent employee to primarily work in Road Districts No. 1 and 11 (Wards 6 & 10).

Resolution No. 8188

Motion by Garcie and seconded by Brown to hire Mr. Thomas Watson as a permanent equipment operator working primarily in Road Districts No. 1 and 11 (Wards 6 & 10) at a beginning salary of \$11.27 per hour, effective December 1, 2018. Mr. Watson will participate in the normal payroll "STEP" plan increases provided by the Police Jury.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

19. Authorize Payment of Approved Bills

Resolution No. 8189

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Funderburk to pay the approved bills.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

20. Appropriate Sales Tax for November Operations (\$215,000)

Resolution No. 8190

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Ebarb to appropriate and transfer \$215,000.00 from the Sales Tax Fund to the Parishwide Transportation Fund for November 2018 operations.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

21. Committee Reports

Road and Shop Committee:

Mr. Byrd opened the floor to discussion concerning which gradall the Police Jury should declare surplus and dispose. President Bison stated that the Road and Shop Committee should examine the condition of both gradalls and make a recommendation to the full Jury as to which piece of equipment to sell. Mr. Sepulvado suggested that the Road Superintendent investigate the gradalls and recommend which one to sell.

Resolution No. 8191

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Garcie to authorize the Road and Shop Committee to work with the Road Superintendent and the gradall operator to review the overall condition of both pieces of equipment and make the decision as to which gradall to sell.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

Mr. Byrd recommended the purchase of a new pickup truck for the Road Superintendent. The pickup truck currently used by the Road Superintendent has major electrical problems which various mechanics have been unable to repair. President Bison suggested declaring the current Road Superintendent's truck surplus and purchasing a new truck for him.

The Police Jury has obtained three quotes for a replacement truck. Two quotes are for less than thirty thousand dollars; therefore, a public bid is not necessary.

Resolution No. 8192

Motion by Byrd and seconded by McCormic to authorize the purchase of a new pickup truck for the Road Superintendent from Foy Motors with cost of less than thirty thousand dollars.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

Mr. Byrd informed the Jury that a road in Road District 1 (Ward 6), Russell Road, needs to have its name changed to Russell Loop in order to be in conformity with 911 records.

Resolution No. 8193

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Garcie to change the name of Russell Road located in Road District 1 (Ward 6) to Russell Loop.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

Mr. Carlton Salley was hired as an equipment operator working primarily in Road Districts 4 and 20 (Wards 7 and 9) on November 19, 2018. Mr. Salley has passed the physical and drug test required for employment.

Resolution No. 8194

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Byrd to ratify the hiring of Mr. Carlton Salley as an equipment operator working primarily in Road Districts 4 and 20 (Wards 7 and 9) on November 19, 2018. Mr. Salley will be a temporary employee working thirty-six (36) hours each week at the beginning pay rate of \$11.27 per hour. As a temporary employee, Mr. Carlton will not participate in the normal payroll "STEP" increases provided by the Police Jury. The Police Jury will reconsider hiring Mr. Carlton as a permanent employee during the regularly scheduled meeting on January 16, 2019.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

22. Operations

There was a brief discussion concerning the issuance and enforcement of road permits.

23. Adjournment

Resolution No 8195

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Funderburk to adjourn.

The voting was as follows:

Yeas: 9 Nays: 0 Absent: 0

s/William E. Weatherford
William E. Weatherford
Secretary Treasurer

s/Ronald L. Bison
Ronald L. Bison
President